
 

 
City of Louisville 

Department of Planning and Building Safety 

 
 
 

Building Code Board of Appeals 
Agenda 

September 19, 2013 
City Hall, Spruce Room 

749 Main Street 
6:30 PM 

I. Call to Order 
II. Roll Call 
III. Approval of Agenda 
IV. Approval of Minutes 

 July 18, 2013 
V. Public Comments on Items Not on the Agenda 
VI. Regular Business 

 2012 Building Code Adoption 
 Louisville Municipal Code Contractor License 

VII. Discussion – Direction 
 Board Vacancies/Term Ending 

VIII. Update  
IX. Staff Comments 
X. Board Comments 
XI. Date of next meeting 

 November 21, 2013 
XII. Discussion Items for Next Meeting 
XIII. Adjourn 

      749 Main Street     Louisville CO 80027 
303.335.4584 (phone)     303.335.4588 (fax)     www.louisvilleco.gov 



 

 
City of Louisville 

Department of Planning and Building Safety  
     749 Main Street      Louisville CO 80027 

303.335.4584 (phone)     303.335.4550 (fax)     www.LouisvilleCO.gov 

 

 
 

 

Building Code Board of Appeals 
Meeting Minutes 

July 18, 2013 
City Hall, Spruce Room 

749 Main Street 
6:30 PM 

 
CALL TO ORDER – Chairperson Geise called the meeting to order at 6:33 PM. 
ROLL CALL was taken and the following members were present: 

Board Members Present:   Peter Geise, Chairman 
Matthew Berry, Vice Chair 
Robert Van Pelt 
Christopher Tew 

Board Members Absent:    Gary Mancuso 
Staff Members Present:     Ken Swanson, Chief Building Official 

Troy Russ, Director of Planning & Building Safety 
Monica Garland, Permit Technician 

Others Present: Steve Brauneis, Planning Commission 
 Tim Parker, Fire Chief 
 Chris Mestes, Fire Marshall 

APPROVAL OF AGENDA  
Berry moved and Van Pelt seconded the motion to approve the agenda.  Motion 
passed by all members present. 
APPROVAL OF MINUTES  
Van Pelt moved and Geise seconded the motion to approve the May 16, 2013 
minutes.  Motion passed by all members present.  
PUBLIC COMMENTS 
None heard. 
REGULAR BUSINESS  
City Council Study Session 
Staff briefed the Board regarding the City Council Study Session.  The highlighted 
topics at the study session were the upcoming 2012 Code discussions and adoption, 
the residential fire sprinkler codes and energy code.  Geise added the Study Session 



Building Code Board of Appeals  
Meeting Minutes 

July 18, 2013 
Page 2 of 7 

 
is the annual meeting where the Board can update the City Council with who they are 
and what they do. 
DISCUSSION  
Projects for 2013 Building Code Board of Appeals  

I. 2012 Building Codes 
• Chief Parker and Fire Marshall Mestes discussed the residential 

fire codes and what the Louisville Fire Protection District would 
like to see.  Mestes mentioned the townhomes and apartments 
being built looks to be the possible trend from here on out for 
new housing.  He specifically mentioned the three story 
apartments and three story townhomes currently being built in 
Steel Ranch South and the fact fire sprinklers are required in one 
but not the other based on the type of construction; multi-family 
and single family attached.  Van Pelt mentioned one is governed 
by the IBC and the other the IRC.  
 
Staff stated this is the beginning of the Code discussions and 
more input will be needed from other departments, Boards and 
Commissions and citizens and contractors.  Staff has been in 
contact with Tim Pate, Chief Building Official with the City & 
County of Broomfield, and his research into other jurisdictions 
and which have adopted the 2012 codes.  Superior, 
Westminster, and Boulder County have adopted the 2012 
Codes.  
 
Geise asked if there is a height stipulation which would trigger 
the fire sprinkler.  Mestes stated he is unsure of the code without 
a review in the book.  Berry mentions townhouses and 
condominiums are required to have a fire wall separating each 
unit.  Based on the IRC, a middle townhouse unit should have 
firewalls on each side where if there were to be a fire, it should 
have a minimal effect on the outside units.  Van Pelt asked if the 
IFC and IRC relate.  Mestes stated they do. 
 
Parker mentioned the fire sprinkler code was researched and 
discussed in 2009 during the 2009 code adoption process and 
the Fire District still fully endorses the fire sprinkler code.  
Louisville has the highest residential fire loss/deaths in the Front 
Range at six in the last 35 years with one in the last 20-25 years 
being the normal.  Even with the best training and equipment, 
fire loss is still possible.  In the Fire Districts research, it was 
found the fires burn hotter and quicker. With the Louisville Fire 
Protection District being an all-volunteer department, the 
response time equation isn’t always there.  The biggest concern 
is the feeling the code will stifle development. Parker states this 
has not been found during research.  In 2009, there wasn’t the 



Building Code Board of Appeals  
Meeting Minutes 

July 18, 2013 
Page 3 of 7 

 
infrastructure in place for the certification and training for 
residential fire sprinkler review and inspections and this has 
been resolved in the last few years.  There is a memo from 2009 
with a note to revisit the fire sprinkler code at the next code 
adoption discussion.  Parker feels Superior is the best example 
since they made the decision to be a fire safe community and 
feels we should look toward them as an example. 
 
Geise asked what is in the code regarding what square footage 
triggers the sprinkler requirement.  Berry asked if there would be 
a separate line for the sprinklers.  Staff replies there is a rule 
which allows it to share the domestic line.  Berry asked if it was 
after or before the meter.  Geise replies there is a separate pump 
that would run a tank with the water in it. Mestes added the tank 
is between 300-500 gallons so the water would not be pulled off 
the system, but from the tank to contain the fire.   
 
Geise asked what would be required with the lines and tanks in 
basements if the City required sprinklers.  Staff replies this is part 
of the discussion.  Berry adds the utilities must be on at the 
property for the sprinklers to even work.  
 
Staff provided copies of the research by Tim Pate and mentions 
this will provide the back up as to how other jurisdictions have 
handled fire sprinklers. Geise asked if the jurisdictions adopted 
the 2012 codes in their entirety.  Parker stated he believed 
jurisdictions who have, or will adopt the 2012 codes, will make a 
few amendments.   Staff feels the sprinklers are up and coming 
and it is a matter of time.  Parker states this is the first time the 
American Fire Association has endorsed it and feels it is due to 
so many firefighters have been killed at over 100 a year. 
 
Geise asks which code the Fire District is currently on.  Mestes 
states they are on the 2009 and try to keep in line with those 
codes adopted by the City. 
 
Van Pelt asked if there are any other big changes in the 2012 
codes.  Mestes feels this is the biggest and there are more minor 
changes. 
 
Tew mentions a Council member’s emphasis on sprinklers in 
multi-family homes and asked how difficult it would be to remove 
the requirement for single family homes. He stated the 
requirement for townhomes would remain. Berry and Van Pelt 
explain the difference between the townhomes and apartments 
and condos.  Parker explains he always tries to convince the 



Building Code Board of Appeals  
Meeting Minutes 

July 18, 2013 
Page 4 of 7 

 
homeowner to install sprinklers by pointing out the overall cost 
and insurance savings.   He believes the impact is felt at a 
greater scale in multi-family homes since there is more than one 
family.   He also states the man power required putting out a fire 
is greater with multi-family homes when it is not sprinkled and 
feels this is the biggest push.  With sprinkled homes, the Fire 
District will have a head start in fighting the fires especially in 
areas with smaller roads.   
 
Geise asked if the sprinkler might change the size of the tap thus 
having an effect on the fees.  Mestes says there is no fee for the 
sprinkler tap if it is separate.  Berry brings up with a residential 
water fee, you are charged with the diameter of the pipe.  Staff 
agrees and says a lot of times the size of the tap is right at the 
line between the changes in size.  Van Pelt adds the tap fees 
and how they are assessed should not be lost in the discussion 
process. 
 
Berry asked if there is a rule of thumb toward the cost per 
sprinkler head.  Geise has worked on a few custom homes with 
the square footage of 8,000+ and believes the cost has been 
between $10,000 - $15,000 for each sprinkler system.  Berry 
agrees he had heard around $15,000.  Geise states that for a 
smaller home around 5,000 square feet, it might be closer to 
$8,000 - $10,000.  
 
Parker adds the Fire District was successful in adding tougher 
commercial sprinkler code in 2009 to include everything over 
5,000 square feet with and A, E and B occupancy along with 
certain building types as required to be sprinkled. 
 
Brauneis states the discussion about costs and developer 
sensitivity are key points in the discussion and possible adoption 
of the green code.  From a Planning Commission perspective, 
through the comp plan process, there is a shift from a green-fill 
town to a mentality to when, where, why, how much needs to 
change and the City will be more in-fill.  From an outsiders view, 
Brauneis does see the cost as the biggest issue with the 
sprinkler code and the impact it will have on older homes.  Staff 
feels the homeowners will focus on wanting the option not the 
requirement. 
 
Parker adds Staff needs to remember, in the research which has 
been done by Pate, most of the Fire Departments are not 
volunteer and they have more staff on hand than a volunteer 
Department.   



Building Code Board of Appeals  
Meeting Minutes 

July 18, 2013 
Page 5 of 7 

 
 
Tew stated the energy code goes beyond the life safety focus of 
the Building Codes.  Berry agrees and feels it is a life style code 
which should include other departments/division. Van Pelt adds 
the IgCC is a sweeping code which would include the Planning 
Department.   
 
Brauneis stated the green code is a design code pertaining to 
the long run, and there will be a learning curve.  
 
Berry feels the fire code helps to protect the neighbors in case of 
a fire and the IgCC is more for the community and it can be 
almost impossible to do with so many codes to enforce. 
 
Brauneis mentions the IgCC will add to the building expense but 
might add to the safety of the structure.  Because of these codes 
there is now a group of people who recognize the cost 
effectiveness of the performance side of energy. 
 
Staff stated there have been discussions with Troy Russ, 
Planning and Building Safety Director, regarding the IgCC and 
how other city departments need to involve as well as the 
community. Education is a key factor in the enforcement and 
awareness of codes, current and the possible adoption of the 
2012 codes.  Staff mentioned the Building Safety Division has 
requested an increase in the 2014 education budget.  
 
Geise mentions the effect the non-adoption of the 2012 codes 
will have on the City’s ISO rating.  This may also be a key factor 
in maintaining and adopting the currents codes. 
 
Brauneis is hoping these discussions will also be an opportunity 
to educate the Boards and Commissions regarding the green 
codes and who needs to be involved in the process.  Geise adds 
the Board has been reviewing the green codes for the last seven 
years and seeing what has or hasn’t worked with other 
jurisdictions.  Brauneis adds having the ICC behind a green 
program goes a long way to standardizing a program instead of 
each jurisdiction having to create one of their own.  Van Pelt 
points out the IgCC will hinder some of the construction in the 
CTC area and might be an unattended consequence of adopting 
the code without further review.  
 
Berry asked about the process for ICC’s adoption of new codes.  
Staff explained the process which includes Board meetings, new 
codes case presentations and the voting process.  



Building Code Board of Appeals  
Meeting Minutes 

July 18, 2013 
Page 6 of 7 

 
 
Tew asked how the ICC codes were developed.  Staff explained 
how the codes started under the directions of four different 
geographic areas. To provide a consistency within the code the 
ICC was created which then allowed for amendments based on 
specific jurisdictions requirements.  
 
Van Pelt asked about the upcoming meeting schedule.  Staff 
explained the schedule is intended to move a recommendation 
of approval before the City Council in November.  This would 
require a recommendation from the Board no later than October 
and would include a community meeting in August. If other 
meetings are needed, they will be scheduled.  Van Pelt asked if 
the Board would be running the community meeting.  Staff stated 
this would be a Building Safety Division run meeting.  The Board 
is welcome to come, but their presence is not required. 
 
Geise asked the Board for their input since they have had a 
chance to review the significant changes and the 2012 IBC and 
IRC.    Berry stated structurally there was a 5 mph increase to 
the wind speed and then a factor was added to bring the wind 
speed back down.  This might require a change in the wind 
speed map, but further review will be needed for this 
determination.  All other structural quirks, from past codes, seem 
to have been fixed.  Geise couldn’t see any additional significant 
changes.  Staff added the residential sprinkler topic reflects the 
most significant change. Staff is hesitant to adopt the code with a 
lot of amendments.  Van Pelt stated Chapter 10 is probably the 
chapter with the most changes dealing mostly with wording and 
definitions.   He stated the pros and cons should be looked at 
closely.  These will include the training and education of the new 
codes and the ISO rating. Tew asked about the ISO rating and 
who within the City reviews it.  Geise and Brauneis stated the 
City Manager and City Attorney reviews the ISO ranting.  Berry 
adds the rating is a risk rating and it encompasses the whole City 
and the Building Safety code adoption is just a small piece of the 
overall rating.   Van Pelt feels the Board should focus on the 
benefits of the codes which directly affect the life safety. 
 

II. Review of the Louisville Municipal Code (LMC) pertaining to Contractor 
Licensing 

• Staff will bring changes to the LMC pertaining to contractor 
licensing to City Council before the end of the year.  These 
changes will include the removal of the requirement of the 
administrative fee for expired licenses.    

II. Mobile Home Ordinance 



Building Code Board of Appeals  
Meeting Minutes 

July 18, 2013 
Page 7 of 7 

 
• The current Mobile Home Ordinance was approved in 1976.  

Changes have been made and are currently being reviewed by 
the City Attorney.  Staff believes the changes should be going 
toward City Council before the end of the year. 

UPDATE 
None heard.  
STAFF COMMENTS 
None heard.  
BOARD COMMENTS 
Tew asked for additional background information about the comment made at the 
City Council Study Session regarding the Board having had only one appeal case in 
the last 12 years.  Staff explained an appeal would come up only if an individual 
would want to question the Chief Building Officials determination of a code and there 
have been very few instances where an appeal was warranted.   
NEXT MEETING  
The public meeting hosted by the Building Safety Division is tentatively scheduled for 
Thursday, August 15, 2013.  The next regular Board meeting is scheduled for 
Thursday, September 19, 2013. 
DISCUSSION ITEMS FOR NEXT MEETING  

• 2012 Code Adoption/Review 
ADJOURN  
The meeting adjourned at 8:32 PM. 



 
 

Department of Planning and Building Safety          Building Safety Division 
 

749 Main Street   Louisville CO 80027   303.335.4584   www.louisvilleco.gov 

MEMORANDUM 
 
To:  Honorable Chair and Members of the Building Code Board of 

Appeals 
 
From:  Planning and Building Safety Division 
 
Subject:  2012 Building Code Adoption 
 
Date:  September 19, 2013 
 

 
SUMMARY  
 
A draft ordinance amending the Louisville Municipal Code, Chapter 15, 
regarding the adoption of the 2012 Building Code is attached for your review 
prior to the meeting.  
 
Staff is requesting the board’s review, discussion, and recommended edits of 
the attached draft ordinance.  Staff will return October 17, 2013, seeking a 
motion to approve a resolution which advances a final draft of the ordinance 
to City Council for consideration.  
 
BACKGROUND 
The attached draft ordinance represents staff’s initial recommended 
modifications to the Louisville Municipal Code to adopt 2012 Edition of the 
International Building Code and associated documents.  A number of 
modifications to the 2012 International Building Code’s family of documents 
are included in the ordinance.   
 
Two primary modifications include: 1) the requirement to fully sprinkler all new 
residential structures constructed in Louisville; and, 2) Establishing Appendix 
D, Fire Apparatus Access Roads, in the 2012 International Fire Code as a 
guideline, not a standard.   
 
The amended language of the ordinance states that the final determination of 
the required fire access facility dimensions shall be determined mutually 
between the Fire Marshall and the City of Louisville, where any waiver 
request to Appendix D shall include an engineered plan for the alternative 
design of the access facility.  
 
Staff is supporting the inclusion of the required residential sprinklers and 
modifications to the LMC regarding Appendix D of the fire code for the 
following reasons. 
 
1) Residential sprinklers will save lives by: 



a. Providing residents additional time in escaping a fire; 
b. Buy-time for the Louisville Fire Department in responding to a fire. 

 
2) Slower streets save lives.  Roadway safety for all modes of travel is a 

significant community concern.  Requiring residential sprinklers and 
establishing Appendix D of the Fire Code as a guideline, not a standard, 
will allow the City and the Fire District to work together on a case-by case 
basis to ensure the City’s street designs and retrofits provide essential fire 
access requirements without compromising roadway safety  

 
3) Louisville is largely built-out.  Future growth in the City will come from infill 

redevelopment, not green field new development. Infill redevelopment 
implies that homes will be built in closer proximity to one another.   
Residential sprinklers will reduce the risk of individual household fires 
impacting adjacent properties. 
 

RECOMMENDATION 
Staff recommends the Building Code Board of Appeals review, discuss, and 
recommend possible edits to the draft ordinance amending chapter and 
continue the public hearing to October 17, 2013.  Staff will return to the 
Building Code Board of Appeals on October 17, 2013 with a revised 
ordinance for a final motion from the Building Code Board of Appeals which 
advances the final draft of the ordinance to City Council for consideration.  



 

 

 
 
 1

DRAFT 
ORDINANCE NO.  

SERIES 2013 
 
AN ORDINANCE ADOPTING BY REFERENCE THE 2012 EDITION OF THE 
INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE, THE 2012 EDITION OF THE INTERNATIONAL 
RESIDENTIAL CODE, THE 2012 EDITION OF THE INTERNATIONAL MECHANICAL 
CODE, THE 2012 EDITION OF THE INTERNATIONAL FUEL GAS CODE, THE 2012 
EDITION OF THE INTERNATIONAL ENERGY CONSERVATION CODE, THE 2012 
EDITION OF THE INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE, THE 2012 INTERNATIONAL 
PLUMBING CODE, THE 2012 EDITION OF THE EXISTING BUILDING CODE AND 
THE MOST RECENT STATE ADOPTED EDITION OF THE NATIONAL ELECTRICAL 
CODE; ENACTING CERTAIN AMENDMENTS TO THE FOREGOING 
INTERNATIONAL CODES; ESTABLISHING FEES UNDER THE INTERNATIONAL 
BUILDING CODE; AMENDING, REPEALING AND REENACTING CERTAIN 
SECTIONS OF TITLE 15 OF THE LOUISVILLE MUNICIPAL CODE IN CONNECTION 
WITH THE ADOPTION OF THE FOREGOING INTERNATIONAL CODES; AND 
ESTABLISHING PENALTIES FOR VIOLATIONS OF SUCH CODES. 
 

WHEREAS, the City of Louisville is a Colorado home rule municipal corporation 
duly organized and existing under laws of the State of Colorado and the City Charter; 
and; 
 
 WHEREAS, national building and construction standards have been developed 
and from time to time amended and updated, as set forth in various model codes, and it 
is deemed in the best interest of the citizens of Louisville, and in the interest of the 
public health, safety, and general welfare to adopt by reference thereto certain model 
codes and to make certain amendments thereto which are tailored to accommodate 
particular circumstances and requirements of the City; and 
 

WHEREAS, a core value of the City in the 2013 Comprehensive Plan promotes: 
“A Healthy, Vibrant, and Sustainable Economy . . . where the City understands and 
appreciates the trust our residents, property owners, and business owners place in it 
when they invest in Louisville, and where the City is committed to a strong and 
supportive business climate which fosters a healthy and vibrant local and regional 
economy for today and for the future.”, and maintaining current building codes 
contributes to mainlining lower home owner insurance rates throughout the City which is 
important to the economic health of the City; and,  

  
WHEREAS, a second core value of the City in the 2013 Comprehensive Plan 

promotes: Sustainable Practices for the Economy, Community, and the Environment . . . 
where we challenge our government, residents, property owners, and our business 
owners to be innovative with sustainable practices so the needs of today are met 



 

 

 
 
 2

without compromising the needs of future generations.”, and maintaining current 
building codes provides additional energy conservation and best building practices 
which are both recognized as a sustainable community practices; and,  
 

WHEREAS, a third core value of the City in the 2013 Comprehensive Plan 
promotes: A Balanced Transportation System . . . where the City desires to make 
motorists, transit customers, bicyclists and pedestrians of all ages and abilities partners 
in mobility, and where the City intends to create and maintain a multimodal 
transportation system to ensure that each user can move in ways that contribute to the 
economic prosperity, public health, and exceptional quality of life in the City.”, and 
balancing the design of the streets which ensure appropriate fire access and multimodal 
safety is necessary to ensure overall safety to the community; and,  
 

WHEREAS, a fourth core value of the City in the 2013 Comprehensive Plan 
promotes: Safe Neighborhoods . . . where the City ensures our policies and actions 
maintain safe, thriving and livable neighborhoods so residents of all ages experience a 
strong sense of community and personal security.”, and requiring sprinklers in all 
residential structures along with requiring best engineering practices to create safer 
streets will ensure safer neighborhoods in Louisville; and, 

 
 WHEREAS, after a duly noticed public hearing held September 19, 2013 and 
continued to October 17, 2013, where evidence and testimony were entered into the 
record,  the Louisville Building Code Board of Appeals and City staff reviewed the 2012 
Editions of the International Building Code, International Residential Code, International 
Mechanical Code, International Fuel Gas Code, International Energy Conservation 
Code, International Fire Code, International Plumbing Code, Existing Building Code and 
the most recent State adopted Edition of the National Electrical Code and recommends 
adoption of the same to the City Council; and 

 
WHEREAS, City Council has provided notice of a public hearing on said ordinance 

by publication as provided by law and held a public hearing as provided in said notice; 
 
 NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY 
OF LOUISVILLE, COLORADO: 
 
 Section 1. Chapter 15.04 of the Louisville Municipal Code is hereby repealed 
and reenacted, with amendments, to read as follows: 
 
Sec. 15.04.010.  Adoption.   
   
 The International Building Code, 2012 Edition published by the International 
Code Council, 4051 West Flossmoor Road, Country Club Hills, Illinois, 60478, is hereby 
adopted by reference thereto and incorporated into and made a part of the city Code. 



 

 

 
 
 3

The purpose and subject matter of the International Building Code include regulating 
construction aspects of building through comprehensive provisions and standards 
regulating the erection, construction, enlargement, alteration, equipping, use, height, 
area, and maintenance of buildings and structures and providing greater safety to the 
public by uniformity in building laws. Except as otherwise provided in this chapter, the 
2012 International Building Code is adopted in full, including the outline of contents, 
index, and appendices as adopted herein and contained therein. Any reference to the 
International Building Code within this chapter shall be to the 2012 Edition of such code. 
 
Sec. 15.04.020.  Amendments. 
   
 The following amendments set forth in sections 15.04.030 through 15.04.110 are 
made to the 2012 International Building Code. 
 
Sec. 15.04.030.  Appendices adopted.  
  
 The following appendices of the 2012 International Building Code are hereby 
specifically adopted; any appendices not listed are not adopted: Appendix C, 
Agricultural Buildings; Appendix G, Flood-Resistant Construction; Appendix I, Patio 
Covers; Appendix J, Grading. 
 
Sec. 15.04.040.  Section 101.1 Title.  
 
 Section 101.1 of the 2012 International Building Code is amended to insert “the 
City of Louisville” so the section will read: 
 
101.1 Title. These regulations shall be known as the Building Code of the City of 
Louisville, hereinafter referred to as “this code.” 
 
Sec.15.04.050. Section 109.2 Schedule for permit fees 
 
 Section 109.2 of the code shall read as follows: 
  
109.2 Schedule of permit fees. On buildings, structures, electrical, gas, mechanical and 
plumbing systems or alterations requiring a permit, a fee for each permit shall be paid 
as required, as set forth in the fees established by the current adopted annual fee 
resolution for the City of Louisville, Colorado.   
 
Sec. 15.04.060.  Section 105.2 added—Work exempt from permit   
 
 The following paragraph is added to the Building portion of Section 105.2 of the 
2012 International Building Code: 
 



 

 

 
 
 4

14.    PERMIT NOT REQUIRED. A Building Permit will NOT be required for the 
renovation, remodel and/or repair of an existing residence only where: 

a) The work is to be done by the owner or occupant, and 
b) The size of the structure will not be increased, and 
c) The structural members (design) i.e., foundations, underpinning, bearing, or 

framing, will not be altered or changed, and 
d) The scope of the work will exclude any electrical, plumbing or heating, and 
e) The TOTAL COST of labor and materials will not exceed $500.00. 

 
Sec. 15.04.070.  Section 105.5 amended - Permit expiration.   
 
 The first paragraph of Section 105.5 of 2012 International Building Code shall 
read as follows: 
 
105.5 Expiration. Except for permits for alterations involving only one discipline, every 
permit issued by the building official under the provisions of this code shall expire by 
limitation and become null and void if the building or work authorized by such permit is 
not commenced within 180 days from the date of such permit, or if the building or work 
authorized by such permit is suspended or abandoned at any time after the work is 
commenced for a period of 180 days. Every permit for alterations involving only one 
discipline which is issued by the building official under the provisions of this code shall 
expire by limitation and become null and void if the building or work authorized by such 
permit is not commenced within 90 days from the date of such permit, or if the building 
or work authorized by such permit is suspended or abandoned at any time after the 
work is commenced for a period of 90 days. Before such work can be recommenced, a 
new permit shall be first obtained to do so, and the fee therefore shall be one half the 
amount required for a new permit for such work, provided no changes have been made 
or will be made in the original plans and specifications for such work, and provided 
further that such suspension or abandonment has not exceeded one year. In order to 
renew action on a permit after expiration, the permittee shall pay a new full permit fee. 
 
Sec. 15.04.080.  Section 1609.3.2, Wind loads. 
 
 The following Section 1609.3.2 is added to the 2012 International Building Code: 
 
Section 1609.3. Wind Speeds.  The minimum basic wind speed for determining wind 
pressure shall be, for the Special Wind Region which encompasses the City of 
Louisville, V3s=115mph and Vfm=100 as interpolated from Table 1609.3.1.  
 
Sec. 15.04.090.  Section 1608.2 amended - Ground snow loads.  
 
 Section 1608.2 of the 2012 International Building Code is amended by the 
addition of the following sentence inserted at the end of the section:  



 

 

 
 
 5

 
The ground snow load shall be 30 pounds per square foot. 
 
Sec. 15.04.100.  Section 1806.1 amended--Footings; general.   
 
 Item 1 of Section 1809.5 of the 2012 International Building Code shall read as 
follows: 
 
1. Extending 36 inches below finished grade; 
 
Sec. 15.04.120.  Copies available.   
 
 At least one copy of the International Building Code and one copy of each 
secondary code pertaining thereto, as amended herein, all certified to be true and 
accurate, shall be available for public inspection at the office of the Building Safety 
Division between the hours of 8:00 a.m. and 5:00 p.m., Monday through Friday, 
holidays excepted. The Building Safety Division shall at all times maintain a reasonable 
supply of copies of the code available for purchase by the public at a moderate price. 
 
Sec. 15.04.130.  Violations and penalties.   
 
 It shall be unlawful for any person, firm, or corporation to erect, construct, 
enlarge, alter, repair, move, improve, remove, convert or demolish, equip, use, occupy 
or maintain any building or structure or cause or permit the work to be done, in violation 
of the provisions of this chapter or the terms of the code or standards adopted and 
incorporated in this chapter. Any person convicted of a violation of any provision of this 
chapter or of the provisions of the code or standards adopted and incorporated in this 
chapter shall be subject to the penalty provided in section 1.28.010. 
 
Sec. 15.04.140.  Fireplace installation.   
 
A.    Any new or remodeled fireplace to be installed or constructed in any dwelling in the 

city shall be one of the following: 
 1.     A gas appliance; 
 2.     An electric device; or 
 3.    A fireplace or fireplace insert that meets the most stringent emissions 

standards for wood stoves established by the C.R.S. Title 25 Article 7 Colorado 
Department of Public Health and Environment Air Quality Control Commission 
Regulation or any other clean burning device that is approved by the Air Quality 
Control Commission Regulation. 

 



 

 

 
 
 6

B.     It is unlawful for any person to install or construct any new or remodeled fireplace 
which does not comply with this section. Any person violating this section shall 
be subject to the penalty provided in section 1.28.010. 

   
Sec. 15.04.150.  Design Handbook for Downtown Louisville to apply.   
 
 Any addition, remodeling, relocation, construction, or other improvement within 
Downtown Louisville and requiring a building permit, sign permit, or any other permit 
from the city shall comply with all requirements of Design Handbook for Downtown 
Louisville, as adopted and amended from time to time. 
 
Sec. 15.04.160.  Industrial and Commercial Development Design Standards and 
Guidelines to apply.   
 
 Any addition, remodeling, relocation, construction, or other improvement to an 
industrial property or project within the city and requiring a building permit, sign permit, 
or any other permit from the city shall comply with the requirements of City of Louisville 
Industrial Development Design Standards and Guidelines (IDDSG); and the 
Commercial Development Design Standards (CDDSG) as adopted and amended from 
time to time. 
 
 Section 2. A new Chapter 15.05 of the Louisville Municipal Code, entitled 
International Residential Code, is hereby enacted to read as follows: 
 
Sec. 15.05.010 Adoption. 
 
 The International Residential Code, 2012 Edition, published by the International 
Code Council, 4051 West Flossmoor Road, Country Club Hills, Illinois, 60478-5795, is 
hereby adopted by reference thereto and incorporated into and made a part of the city 
Code. The subject matter of the International Residential Code is to regulate and govern 
the construction, alteration, movement, enlargement, replacement, repair, equipment, 
location, removal and demolition of detached one and two family dwellings and multiple 
single family dwellings (townhouses) not more than three stories in height with separate 
means of egress in the City of Louisville, and providing for the issuance of permits and 
collection of fees therefore. 
 
Sec. 15.05.020.  Amendments to the 2012 International Residential Code. 
 
 The following amendments set forth in sections 15.05.030 through 15.05.090 are 
made to the 2012 International Residential Code. 
 
Sec. 15.05.030.  Section R101.1 Title.  
 



 

 

 
 
 7

 Section 101.1 of the 2012 International Residential Code is amended to insert 
“the City of Louisville” so the section will read: 
 
R101.1 Title. These provisions shall be known as the Residential Code for One- and 
Two-Family Dwellings of the City of Louisville, and shall be cited as such and will be 
referred to herein as this code. 

 
Sec. 15.05.040.  Section R108.2 Schedule of permit fees.   
 
 Section R108.2 of the code shall read as follows: 
  
R108.2 Schedule of permit fees. On buildings, structures, electrical, gas, mechanical 
and plumbing systems or alterations requiring a permit, a fee for each permit shall be 
paid as required, as set forth in the fees established by the current adopted annual fee 
resolution for the City of Louisville, Colorado  
 
Sec. 15.05.050.  Table R301.2(1) revised. 
 
Table R301.2(1) is filled in as follows: 
 

TABLE R301.2(1) 
CLIMATIC AND GEOGRAPHIC DESIGN CRITERIA 

 
Ground 
Snow 
Load 

Wind 
Speed 
(mph) 

Seismic 
Design 

Category 

Subject to Damage From 
Winter 
Design 
Temp. 

Ice 
Shield 
Under- 

Layment 
Required 

Flood 
Hazards 

Air 
Freezing 

Index 

Mean 
Annual 
Temp. Weathering 

Frost 
Line 

Depth 
Termite Decay 

30 
Lbs./s.t. 

100-
115 B Severe 36”  

Slight/Moderate 
 

Slight/Moderate 1° Yes 2012 1000- 
2000 47° 

 
Section 15.05.080. Section P3103.1 amended. 
 The number “12” is inserted in two locations of Section P3103.1 so the section 
will read as follows: 
 
P3103.1. Roof extension. All open vent pipes which extend through a roof shall be 
terminated at least 12 inches above the roof or 12 inches above the anticipated snow 
accumulation, except that where a roof is to be used for any purpose other than weather 
protection, the vent extensions shall be run at least 7 feet (2134 mm) above the roof. 
 
Sec. 15.05.100.  Copies available.   
 
 At least one copy of the International Residential Code and one copy of each 
secondary code pertaining thereto, as amended herein, all certified to be true and 
accurate, shall be available for public inspection at the office of the Building Safety 



 

 

 
 
 8

Division between the hours of 8:00 a.m. and 5:00 p.m., Monday through Friday, 
holidays excepted. The Building Safety Division shall at all times maintain a reasonable 
supply of copies of the code available for purchase by the public at a moderate price. 
 
Sec. 15.05.110.  Violations and penalties.   
 
 It shall be unlawful for any person, firm, or corporation to erect, construct, 
enlarge, alter, repair, move, improve, remove, convert or demolish, equip, use, occupy 
or maintain any building or structure or cause or permit the work to be done, in violation 
of the provisions of this chapter or the terms of the code or standards adopted and 
incorporated in this chapter. Any person convicted of a violation of any provision of this 
chapter or of the provisions of the code or standards adopted and incorporated in this 
chapter shall be subject to the penalty provided in section 1.28.010. 
 
Sec. 15.05.120.  Fireplace installation.   
 
A.     Any new or remodeled fireplace to be installed or constructed in any dwelling in 

the city shall be one of the following: 
 1.     A gas appliance; 
 2.     An electric device; or 
 3.    A fireplace or fireplace insert that meets the most stringent emissions 

standards for wood stoves established by the C.R.S. Title 25 Article 7 Colorado 
Department of Public Health and Environment Air Quality Control Commission 
Regulation or any other clean burning device that is approved by the Air Quality 
Control Commission Regulation 

 
B.     It is unlawful for any person to install or construct any new or remodeled fireplace 

which does not comply with this section. Any person violating this section shall 
be subject to the penalty provided in section 1.28.010. 

 
 Section 3. Chapter 15.08 of the Louisville Municipal Code is hereby repealed 
and reenacted, with amendments, to read as follows: 
 
Sec. 15.08.010.  Adoption.   
 
 The International Mechanical Code, 2012 Edition, published by the International 
Code Council, 4051 West Flossmoor Road, Country Club Hills, Illinois, 60478-5795, is 
hereby adopted by reference thereto and incorporated into and made a part of the city 
Code. The purpose and subject matter of International Mechanical Code include 
minimum standards relating to the mechanical installations in or in connection with the 
construction, alteration and repair of new and existing structures including design, 
construction, installation, quality of materials, locations, operation, and maintenance or 



 

 

 
 
 9

use of heating, ventilation, cooling refrigeration systems, incinerators and other 
miscellaneous heat-producing appliances. 
 
Sec. 15.08.020.  Section 101.1 Title.  
 
 Section 101.1 of the Mechanical Code is amended to insert “the City of 
Louisville” so the section will read: 
 
101.1 Title. These regulations shall be known as the Mechanical Code of the City of 
Louisville, hereinafter referred to as this code. 
 
Sec. 15.08.030.  Section 106.5.2.  Fee Schedule.   
 
 Section 106.5.2 of the 2012 International Mechanical Code is amended to read 
as follows: 
 
106.5.2 Fee schedule. Schedule of permit fees. On buildings, structures, electrical, gas, 
mechanical, and plumbing systems or alterations requiring a permit, a fee for each 
permit shall be paid as required, as set forth in the fees established by the current 
adopted annual fee resolution for the City of Louisville, Colorado   
  
Sec. 15.08.040.  Section 106.5.3 Refunds.   
 
 Section 106.5.3 of the 2012 International Mechanical Code is amended to read 
as follows: 
 
106.5.3 Refunds. The building official is authorized to establish a refund policy. 
 
Sec. 15.08.070.  Section 901 amended. 
 
 Section 901 of 2012 the International Mechanical Code is amended to add the 
following new subsection: 
 
Section 901.5. Solid Fuel-Burning Equipment. No permit shall be issued for the 
installation of a solid-fuel-burning fireplace stove, fireplace insert or wood stove 
appliance unless the appliance fully conforms with the requirements for emission 
testing, certification and labeling promulgated pursuant to C.R.S. § Title 25 Article 7 
Colorado Department of Public Health and Environment Air Quality Control Commission 
Regulation or any other clean burning device that is approved by the Air Quality Control 
Commission Regulation Title 25 Article 7  All such appliances to be installed must be 
certified by the Air Quality Control Commission of the state department of health and 
environment to meet the emissions standards set forth in Section IV of Regulation No. 4 



 

 

 
 
 10

of Volume 1 of the state air quality control commission as EPA Phase II or Colorado 
Phase III solid-fuel-burning devices. 
 
Sec. 15.08.080.  Copies available.   
 
 At least one copy of the 2012 International Mechanical Code, as amended 
herein, certified to be true and accurate, shall be available for public inspection at the 
office of the Building Safety Division, between the hours of 8:00 a.m. and 5:00 p.m., 
Monday through Friday, holidays excepted. The Building Safety Division shall at all 
times maintain a reasonable supply of copies of the code available for purchase by the 
public at a moderate price. 
 
 Section 4. A new Chapter 15.10 of the Louisville Municipal Code, entitled 
International Fuel Gas Code, is hereby enacted to read as follows: 
 
15.10.010.  Adoption. 
 
 The International Fuel Gas Code, 2012 Edition, published by the International 
Code Council, 4051 West Flossmoor Road, Country Club Hills, Illinois, 60478-5795, is 
hereby adopted by reference thereto and incorporated into and made a part of the city 
Code. The purpose and subject matter of the International Fuel Gas Code include 
minimum standards relating to the mechanical installations in or in connection with the 
construction, alteration and repair of new and existing structures including design, 
construction, installation, quality of materials, locations, operation, and maintenance or 
use of fuel-gas piping systems, fuel-gas utilization equipment and related accessories. 
 
Sec. 15.10.020.  Section 101.1 Title.  
 
 Section 101.1 of the 2012 International Fuel Gas Code is amended to insert “the 
City of Louisville” so the section will read Insert “the City of Louisville” so the section will 
read: 
 
101.1 Title. These regulations shall be known as the Fuel Gas Code of the City of 
Louisville, hereinafter referred to as this code. 
 
Sec. 15.10.030.  Section 106.5.2.  Fee Schedule. 
 
Section 106.5.2 of the 2012 International Fuel Gas Code is amended to read as follows: 
 
106.5.2 Fee schedule. The fees for mechanical work shall be as indicated in Schedule 
of permit fees. On buildings, structures, electrical, gas, mechanical, and plumbing 
systems or alterations requiring a permit, a fee for each permit shall be paid as required, 



 

 

 
 
 11

as set forth in the fees  established by the current adopted annual fee resolution for the 
City of Louisville, Colorado    
 
Sec. 15.10.040.  Section 108.5.3 Refunds. 
 
 Section 106.5.3 of the 2012 International Fuel Gas Code is amended to read as 
follows: 
 
106.5.3 Refunds. The building official is authorized to establish a refund policy. 
 
 Section 5. Chapter 15.12 of the Louisville Municipal Code is hereby repealed 
and reenacted, with amendments, to read as follows: 
 
Sec. 15.12.010.  Adoption.   
 
 The International Fire Code, 2012 Edition, published by the International Code 
Council, 4051 West Flossmoor Road, Country Club Hills, Illinois, 60478-5795, is hereby 
adopted by reference thereto and incorporated into and made a part of this Code. The 
purpose and subject matter of the International Fire Code include minimum standards 
relating to the storage, handling, and use of hazardous substances, materials and 
devices, and providing greater safety and protection to the public from conditions 
hazardous to life or property in the occupancy of buildings or premises.  
 
Sec. 15.12.020.  Section 101.1 Title.  
 
Section 101.1 of the 2012 International Fire Code is amended to insert “the City of 
Louisville” so the section will read: 
 
101.1 Title. These regulations shall be known as the Fire Code of the City of Louisville, 
hereinafter referred to as this code. 
 
Sec. 15.12.030.  Section 108 deleted. 
 
Section 108 of the 2012 International Fire Code is deleted. 
 
Sec. 15.12.040.  Section 109. Violations. 
 
Section 109 of the 2012 International Fire Code is deleted in its entirety and replaced 
with the following: 
 
109.  Violations.  It shall be unlawful for any person, firm, or corporation to erect, 
construct, enlarge, alter, repair, move, improve, remove, convert or demolish, equip, 
use, occupy or maintain any building or structure or cause or permit the work to be 



 

 

 
 
 12

done, in violation of the provisions of this chapter or the terms of the code or standards 
adopted and incorporated in this chapter. Any person convicted of a violation of any 
provision of this chapter or of the provisions of the code or standards adopted and 
incorporated in this chapter shall be subject to the penalty provided in section 1.28.010. 
 
Sec. 15.12.050.  Section 111.4 Failure to comply-amended.   
 
Section 111.4 of the 2012 International Fire Code is amended to read as follows: 
 
111.4 Failure to comply. Any person who shall continue any work after having been 
served with a stop work order, except such work as that person is directed to perform to 
remove a violation or unsafe condition, shall be in violation of this code. 
 
Sec. 15.12.060.  Section 104.1 General- amended. 
 
 Section 104.1 of the 2012 International Fire Code is amended to read as follows: 
 
104.1 General. The Code Official, Fire Marshall or Chief Building Official is hereby 
authorized to enforce the provisions of this code and shall have the authority to render 
interpretations of this code, and to adopt policies, procedures, rules and regulations in 
order to clarify the application of its provisions. 
 
Sec. 15.12.070. Section 503.2.3 Surface-amended. 
 
Section 503.2.3 of the 2012 International Fire Code is amended to read as follows: 
 
Section 503.2.3. Surface. Fire apparatus access roads shall be designed and 
constructed of hard surface, i.e. asphalt or concrete, to withstand the weight of fire 
apparatus and such surfaces must be able to support the weight of the heaviest fire 
apparatus of the fire district serving the property. The grade of a fire apparatus access 
road shall not exceed seven percent. During the construction of a land use development 
project, the property owner or contractor may apply for a waiver of the requirement to 
construct a hard surface fire apparatus access road. The waiver request shall include 
an engineered plan for the alternative construction of the access road and a plan for the 
continued maintenance of the access road during the period of project construction. 
Upon completion of the project and prior to the issuance of a certificate of occupancy, 
any fire apparatus access road shall be constructed of permanent hard surface. 
 
Sec. 15.12.080.  Section 503.2.4 Turning Radius-amended. 
 
Section 503.2.4 of the 2012 International Fire Code is amended to read as follows: 
 



 

 

 
 
 13

Section 503.2.4 Turning Radius. Refer appendix D of the International Fire Code as 
amended from time to time.: 
 
Sec. 15.12.090.  Appendices adopted.   
 
The following appendices of the International Fire Code are hereby specifically adopted; 
any appendices not listed are not adopted: Appendix B, Fire-Flow Requirements for 
Buildings;  Appendix D, Fire Apparatus Access Roads is adopted as a guideline, not a 
standard.  Final determination of the required access facility dimensions shall be 
determined mutually between the Fire Marshall and the City of Louisville.  A waiver 
request shall include an engineered plan for the alternative construction of the access 
facility.  
 
Sec. 15.12.100.  Copies available.   
 
 At least one copy of the 2012 International Fire Code, as amended herein, 
certified to be true and accurate, shall be available for public inspection at the office of 
the Building Safety Division, between the hours of 8:00 a.m. and 5:00 p.m., Monday 
through Friday, holidays excepted. The Building Safety Division at all times maintains a 
reasonable supply of copies of the code available for purchase by the public at a 
moderate price. 
 
Sec. 15.12.110.  Fire lane requirements.   
 
Refer Appendix D of the International Fire Code as amended from time to time. 
 
Sec. 15.12.120.  Fire lane specifications.   
 
Refer Appendix D of the International Fire Code as amended from time to time. 
 
Sec. 15.12.130.  Placement of fire hydrants.   
 
A.    Fire hydrants shall be placed at each street intersection and on each side of any 

divided highway, roadway or street, wherever possible. 
 
B. In a residential area, there shall be no more than 500 feet of vehicle travel 

distance between hydrants. No residential unit shall be more than 250 feet of 
vehicle travel distance from the nearest hydrant. 

 
C. In multifamily, industrial, business or commercial areas, there shall be no more 

than 300 feet of vehicle travel distance between hydrants. No building shall be 
more than 150 feet of travel distance from the nearest hydrant. 

 



 

 

 
 
 14

D. All water mains serving two or more fire hydrants shall have a looped water 
distribution system with approved sectional valves being provided. 

 
E. The barrel of a fire hydrant shall be set perpendicular to the ground or the 

designed final grade with the lowest discharge outlet 18 inches above grade. 
 
F. A minimum of three feet of clearance space shall be maintained around the 

circumference of a fire hydrant except as otherwise required or approved by the 
city. 

 
G. The minimum required residual pressure for a water supply to any given area 

shall be 20 psi. In the event that a minimum water pressure of 20 psi cannot be 
obtained in any given area, large water mains shall be installed with closer than 
the required minimum spacing of fire hydrants to increase flow. 

 
Sec.15.12.140. Key boxes required. 
 
Section 506.1 of the 2012 International Fire Code is amended with the addition of this 
sentence: All new commercial construction requires a key box to be installed. 
 
Sec.15.12.150. Automatic Fire Sprinklers. 
 
Section 903.2.1. is amended as follows: 
903.2.1.1 Group A-1. 1. The number changes from 12,000 to 5,000 square feet. 
903.2.1.3 Group A-3. 1. The number changes from 12,000 to 5,000 square feet. 
903.2.1.4 Group A-4. 1. The number changes from 12,000 to 5,000 square feet 
 
Section 903.2.2 is amended as follows: 
903.2.2 Group B. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided for Group B 
occupancies where the fire area exceeds 5,000 square feet. 
 
Section 903.2.3 is amended as follows: 
903.2.3 Group E. 1. The number changes from 12,000 to 5,000 square feet. 
 
These changes are only specific to new construction. 
 
Sec.15.12.160. Standards of Reference 
Standards of reference for the International Fire Code are: 
            The 2012 Edition of the ICC International Wildland-Urban Interface Code 
            The 2012 Edition of the NFPA Life Safety Code 
            The 2012 Edition of the NFPA Codes and Standards 
    
  



 

 

 
 
 15

 Section 6. Chapter 15.16 of the Louisville Municipal Code is hereby repealed 
and reenacted, with amendments, to read as follows: 
 
Sec. 15.16.010.  Adoption. 
 
 The International Plumbing Code, 2012 Edition, published by the International 
Code Council, 4051 West Flossmoor Road, Country Club Hills, Illinois, 60478-5795, is 
adopted by reference thereto and incorporated into and made part of the Louisville 
Municipal Code. The purpose and subject matter of the International Plumbing Code, 
include comprehensive provisions regulating plumbing installations in or in connection 
with new and existing structures and providing International plumbing standards for the 
purpose of protecting the public health, safety and general welfare. 
 
Sec. 15.16.020 Amendments.   
 
 The following amendments set forth in sections 15.16.030 through 15.16.130 are 
made to the 2012 International Plumbing Code. 
 
Sec. 15.16.030 Section 101.1 Title.  
 
Section 101.1 of the 2012 International Plumbing Code is amended to insert “the City of 
Louisville” so the section will read: 
 
P101.1 Title. These regulations shall be known as the Plumbing Code of the City of 
Louisville, hereinafter referred to as “this code.” 
 
Sec. 15.16.040.  Section 106.6.2  Schedule of permit fees.   
 
Section 106.6.2 shall read as follows: 
  
P106.6.2 Fee schedule.  The fees for all plumbing work shall be as set forth in Schedule 
of permit fees. On buildings, structures, electrical, gas, mechanical, and plumbing 
systems or alterations requiring a permit, a fee for each permit shall be paid as required, 
as set forth in the fees established by the current adopted annual fee resolution for the 
City of Louisville, Colorado   
 
Sec. 15.16.050.  Section 106.6.3 Refunds.   
 
Section 106.6.3 is amended to read as follows: 
 
106.6.3 Refunds. The building official is authorized to establish a refund policy. 
 
Sec. 15.16.060.  Section 108.4 Violations.   



 

 

 
 
 16

 
Delete Section 108 in its entirety and replace with the following: 
 
108.4 Violations.  It shall be unlawful for any person, firm, or corporation to erect, 
construct, enlarge, alter, repair, move, improve, remove, convert or demolish, equip, 
use, occupy or maintain any building or structure or cause or permit the work to be 
done, in violation of the provisions of this chapter or the terms of the code or standards 
adopted and incorporated in this chapter. Any person convicted of a violation of any 
provision of this chapter or of the provisions of the code or standards adopted and 
incorporated in this chapter shall be subject to the penalty provided in section 1.28.010. 
 
Sec. 15.16.070.  Section 108 Stop work orders. 
 
The last sentence of Section 108 is amended to read as follows: 
 
Any person who shall continue any work in or about the structure after having been 
served with a stop work order, except such work as that person is directed to perform to 
remove a violation or unsafe condition, shall be subject to the penalty provided in 
section 1.28.010. 
 
Sec. 15.16.090.  Section 904.1 Roof extension. 
 
The number “12” is inserted so that section 904.1 will read as follows: 
 
904.1 Roof Extension.  All open vent pipes that extend through a roof shall be 
terminated at least 12 inches above the roof, except that where a roof is to be used for 
any purpose other than weather protection, the vent extensions shall be run at least 7 
feet above the roof. 
 
Sec. 15.16.100. Backflow prevention assemblies. 
 
A new Section 107.3.3 is added, to read as follows:       
 
107.3.3 Backflow Prevention Assemblies. The premise owner or responsible person 
shall have the backflow prevention assembly tested by a certified backflow assembly 
tester at the time of installation, repair, or relocation. 
 
Sec. 15.16.110 Food waste grinders. 
 
Section 1003.3.2 is amended to read as follows: 
 
1003.3.2 Food Waste Grinders.  Unless specifically required or permitted by the code 
official, no food waste grinder or dishwasher shall be connected to or discharge into any 



 

 

 
 
 17

grease trap.  Where food waste grinders connect to grease interceptors, the grease 
interceptor shall be sized and rated for the discharge of the food waste grinder. 
 
Exception: Special regulations by the Public Works Department may supersede this 
requirement. 
 
Sec. 15.16.120.  Copies available.   
 
At least one copy of the 2012 International Plumbing Code, as adopted and amended, 
certified to be true and accurate, shall be available for public inspection at the office of 
the Building Safety Division between the hours of 8:00 a.m. and 5:00 p.m., Monday 
through Friday, holidays excepted. The city clerk shall at all times maintain a reasonable 
supply of copies of the code available for purchase by the public at a moderate price. 
 
Sec. 15.16.130.  Violations and penalties.   
 
It is unlawful for any person, firm, or corporation to erect, construct, enlarge, alter, 
repair, move, improve, remove, convert or demolish, equip, use, occupy or maintain any 
plumbing or cause or permit such work to be done, in violation of the provisions of this 
chapter or the terms of the code adopted and incorporated in this chapter, or to 
otherwise violate or fail to comply with this chapter or such code. Any person convicted 
of a violation of any provision of this chapter or of the provisions of the code adopted 
and incorporated in this chapter shall be subject to the penalty provided in section 
1.28.010. 
 
 Section 7. A new Chapter 15.18 of the Louisville Municipal Code, entitled 
International Energy Conservation Code, is hereby enacted to read as follows: 
 
Sec. 15.18.010.  Adoption. 
 
 The International Energy Conservation Code, 2012 Edition, published by the 
International Code Council, 4051 West Flossmoor Road, Country Club Hills, Illinois, 
60478-5795, is hereby adopted by reference thereto and incorporated into and made a 
part of the city Code. The subject matter of the International Energy Conservation Code 
is regulate and govern energy efficient building envelopes and installation of energy 
efficient mechanical, lighting and power systems in the City of Louisville, and providing 
for the issuance of permits and collection of fees therefor. 
 
Sec. 15.18.020.  Section 101.1 Title. 
 
Section 101.1 of the 2012 International Energy Conservation Code is amended to insert 
“the City of Louisville” so the section will read: 
 



 

 

 
 
 18

101.1 Title. These regulations shall be known as the 2012 Energy Conservation Code of 
the City of Louisville, hereinafter referred to as “this code.” 
 
 Section 8.  Chapter 15.28 of the Louisville Municipal Code, entitled Uniform 
Code for the Abatement of Dangerous Buildings, is hereby repealed in its entirety. 
 
 Section 9.  Chapter 15.32 of the Louisville Municipal Code is hereby repealed 
and reenacted, with amendments, to read as follows: 
 
Sec. 15.32.010.  Construction of solid fences.   
 
 All fences constructed in the city shall conform to the minimum standards 
contained in this chapter and other applicable codes. Permits shall be required for 
installation with fees determined pursuant to section 15.04.050. 
 
Sec. 15.32.020.  Construction standards; minimum.   
 
 All solid fences must be constructed to meet the following minimum design 
standards: 
 
A. All solid fences four feet to six feet in height shall have one four by four wood 

post, or equivalent, every 30 square feet of fence area. 
 
B. For fences four feet to five feet in height, two horizontal stiffeners are required. 

The lower stiffeners shall be within 12 inches to ground level and the upper 
stiffeners shall be 12 inches to the top of the posts. 

 
C. For fences over five feet in height, three horizontal stiffeners shall be required, 

equally spaced from ground level to the top of the fence. 
 
D. All posts for fences of four feet to six feet in height shall be set in concrete at a 

depth of not less than 1 1/2 feet into the ground. Diameter of the concrete 
required under this section shall not be less than eight inches. 

 
E. All fences constructed under this standard must be kept in good repair. 
 
 
 Section 13.  Chapter 15.48 of the Louisville Municipal Code is hereby repealed 
and reenacted, with amendments, to read as follows: 
 
Sec. 15.48.010.  Adoption.   
 
 Pursuant to C.R.S. Title 31, Article 16, as amended: 



 

 

 
 
 19

 
 The National Electrical Code, most recent edition adopted by the State of 
Colorado, published by the National Fire Protection Association, 1 Batterymarch Park, 
P.O. Box 9101, Quincy, MA 02269-9101, is adopted by reference thereto and 
incorporated into and made a part of the Louisville Municipal Code. The purpose and 
subject matter of the National Electrical Code include minimum regulations for the 
practical safeguarding of persons and property from the hazards arising from the use of 
electricity and minimum standards relating to the installation of electrical conductors and 
equipment within or on public and private buildings and other structures, including 
mobile homes, recreational vehicles, and floating dwelling units, and other premises 
such as yards, carnivals, parking and other lots, and industrial substations.  
 
Sec. 15.48.020.  Section 80.13 (13) revised. 
 
 Section 80.13(13) of the currently adopted National Electrical Code is amended 
to read as follows: 
 
Whenever any installation subject to inspection prior to use is covered or concealed 
without having first been inspected, the authority having jurisdiction shall be permitted to 
require that such work be exposed for inspection. The authority having jurisdiction shall 
be notified when the installation is ready for inspection and shall conduct the inspection 
within three (3) days. 
 
Section 15.48.030.  Section 80.15 deleted. 
 
 Section 80.15 of the currently adopted National Electrical Code, regarding the 
Electrical Board, is deleted in its entirety. 
 
Section 15.48.040.  Section 80.19 (F) (3) revised. 
 
 Section 80.19 (F) (3) of the currently adopted National Electrical Code is 
amended to read as follows: 
 
When any portion of the electrical installation within the jurisdiction of an Electrical 
Inspector is to be hidden from view by the permanent placement of parts of the building, 
the person, firm, or corporation installing the equipment shall notify the Electrical 
Inspector, and such equipment shall not be concealed until it has been approved by the 
Electrical Inspector, provided that on large installations, where the concealment of 
equipment proceeds continuously, the person, firm, or corporation installing the 
equipment shall give the Electrical Inspector due notice in advance, and inspections 
shall be made periodically during the progress of the work. 
 
Sec. 15.48.050.  Permit fees 



 

 

 
 
 20

 
 The permit fees for electrical work within the City of Louisville shall be calculated 
in accordance with the schedule as established by the Schedule of permit fees. On 
buildings, structures, electrical, gas, mechanical, and plumbing systems or alterations 
requiring a permit, a fee for each permit shall be paid as required, as set forth in the 
fees established by the current adopted annual fee resolution for the City of Louisville, 
Colorado    
 
Sec. 15.48.060.  Interpretation.   
 
 In case of a dispute or a question regarding the interpretation of the National 
Electrical Code where the matter is not specified by ordinance of the city, the 
interpretation of the state electrical board and their policies shall prevail and be enforced 
as part of the National Electrical Code by the city. 
 
Sec. 15.48.070.  Article 225 amended.   
 
 Article 225 of the currently adopted National Electrical Code is amended by the 
addition of a new section 225-32 to read as follows: 
 
225-32. Location. The disconnecting means shall be installed at an approved, readily 
accessible location nearest the point of entrance of the conductors either directly inside 
an exterior door at grade level or at grade level outside of each building or structure 
served. This disconnect location shall apply to conductors that pass through the building 
or structure in Article 225-31. 
 
Sec. 15.48.080.  Section 230-70(a) amended. 
 
 Section 230-70(a) of the currently adopted National Electrical Code is amended 
to read as follows: 
 
230-70(a). Location. The service disconnecting means shall be installed at an approved, 
readily accessible location outside of a building or structure at grade level. 
 
EXCEPTION NO. 1: The service disconnecting means may be installed inside the 
building or structure provided it is directly inside an exterior door at grade level 
immediately adjacent to the entrance of the service conductors and metering 
equipment. 
 
EXCEPTION NO. 2: A remote keyed switch may be installed in an approved location 
adjacent to the fire department's emergency access to the building or structure, 
provided, ground-fault protection for equipment is installed in accordance with the 
provisions of section 230-95. 



 

 

 
 
 21

  
 Section 14. If any portion of this ordinance is held to be invalid for any reason, 
such decision shall not affect the validity of the remaining portions of this ordinance.  The 
City Council hereby declares that it would have passed this ordinance and each part 
hereof irrespective of the fact that any one part be declared invalid. 
  
 Section 15. Any person who violates any provision of this Ordinance shall be 
punished by a fine of not more than $1,000 or by imprisonment not to exceed one (1) year 
or both such fine and imprisonment.  Each day during any portion of which any violation of 
any provision of this ordinance is committed, continued, or permitted by any such person 
shall be a separate offense. 
 
 Section 16. The repeal or modification of any provision of the Municipal Code of 
the City of Louisville by this ordinance shall not release, extinguish, alter, modify, or 
change in whole or in part any penalty, forfeiture, or liability, either civil or criminal, which 
shall have been incurred under such provision, and each provision shall be treated and 
held as still remaining in force for the purpose of sustaining any and all proper actions, 
suits, proceedings, and prosecutions for the enforcement of the penalty, forfeiture, or 
liability, as well as for the purpose of sustaining any judgment, decree, or order which can 
or may be rendered, entered, or made in such actions, suits, proceedings, or prosecutions. 
 
 Section 17. All other ordinances or portions thereof inconsistent or conflicting with 
this ordinance or any portion hereof are hereby repealed to the extent of such 
inconsistency or conflict. 
 
 INTRODUCED, READ, PASSED ON FIRST READING, AND ORDERED 
PUBLISHED this     day of               , 2013. 
 
 
       ______________________________ 
        Robert P. Muckle, Mayor 
ATTEST: 
 
 
______________________________ 
  Nancy Varra, City Clerk 
 
APPROVED AS TO FORM: 
 
 
______________________________ 
Light, Kelly & Dawes, P.C. 
   City Attorney 



 

 

 
 
 22

 
 
 PASSED AND ADOPTED ON SECOND AND FINAL READING, this   day of      , 
2013. 
 
 
 
 
       ______________________________ 
        Robert P. Muckle, Mayor 
 
 
ATTEST: 
 
 
 
______________________________ 
   Nancy Varra, City Clerk 
 



 

 
 1

RESOLUTION NO. 1 
 SERIES 2013 

 
A RESOLUTION RECOMMENDING APPROVAL OF AMENDMENTS TO TITLE 15 
OF THE LOUISVILLE MUNICIPAL CODE TO ADOPT BY REFERENCE THE 2012 
EDITION OF THE INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE, THE 2012 EDITION OF THE 
INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE, THE 2012 EDITION OF THE 
INTERNATIONAL MECHANICAL CODE, THE 2012 EDITION OF THE 
INTERNATIONAL FUEL GAS CODE, THE 2012 EDITION OF THE INTERNATIONAL 
ENERGY CONSERVATION CODE, THE 2012 EDITION OF THE INTERNATIONAL 
FIRE CODE, THE 2012 INTERNATIONAL PLUMBING CODE, THE 2012 EDITION OF 
THE EXISTING BUILDING CODE AND THE MOST RECENT STATE ADOPTED 
EDITION OF THE NATIONAL ELECTRICAL CODE; ENACTING CERTAIN 
AMENDMENTS TO THE FOREGOING INTERNATIONAL CODES; ESTABLISHING 
FEES UNDER THE INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE; AMENDING, REPEALING 
AND REENACTING CERTAIN SECTIONS OF TITLE 15 OF THE LOUISVILLE 
MUNICIPAL CODE IN CONNECTION WITH THE ADOPTION OF THE FOREGOING 
INTERNATIONAL CODES; AND ESTABLISHING PENALTIES FOR VIOLATIONS OF 
SUCH CODES. 
 
 WHEREAS, Title 15 of the Louisville Municipal Code establish regulations 
regarding the construction of buildings within the City of Louisville; and 
 

WHEREAS, national building and construction standards have been developed 
and from time to time amended and updated, as set forth in various model codes, and it 
is deemed in the best interest of the citizens of Louisville, and in the interest of the 
public health, safety, and general welfare to adopt by reference thereto certain model 
codes and to make certain amendments thereto which are tailored to accommodate 
particular circumstances and requirements of the City; and 
 

WHEREAS, a core value of the City in the 2013 Comprehensive Plan promotes: 
“A Healthy, Vibrant, and Sustainable Economy . . . where the City understands and 
appreciates the trust our residents, property owners, and business owners place in it 
when they invest in Louisville, and where the City is committed to a strong and 
supportive business climate which fosters a healthy and vibrant local and regional 
economy for today and for the future.”, and maintaining current building codes 
contributes to mainlining lower home owner insurance rates throughout the City which is 
important to the economic health of the City; and,  

  
WHEREAS, a second core value of the City in the 2013 Comprehensive Plan 

promotes: Sustainable Practices for the Economy, Community, and the Environment . . . 
where we challenge our government, residents, property owners, and our business 
owners to be innovative with sustainable practices so the needs of today are met 
without compromising the needs of future generations.”, and maintaining current 
building codes provides additional energy conservation and best building practices 
which are both recognized as a sustainable community practices; and,  
 



 

 
 2

WHEREAS, a third core value of the City in the 2013 Comprehensive Plan 
promotes: A Balanced Transportation System . . . where the City desires to make 
motorists, transit customers, bicyclists and pedestrians of all ages and abilities partners 
in mobility, and where the City intends to create and maintain a multimodal 
transportation system to ensure that each user can move in ways that contribute to the 
economic prosperity, public health, and exceptional quality of life in the City.”, and 
balancing the design of the streets which ensure appropriate fire access and multimodal 
safety is necessary to ensure overall safety to the community; and,  
 

WHEREAS, a fourth core value of the City in the 2013 Comprehensive Plan 
promotes: Safe Neighborhoods . . . where the City ensures our policies and actions 
maintain safe, thriving and livable neighborhoods so residents of all ages experience a 
strong sense of community and personal security.”, and requiring sprinklers in all 
residential structures along with requiring best engineering practices to create safer 
streets will ensure safer neighborhoods in Louisville; and, 

 
 WHEREAS, after a duly noticed public hearing held September 19, 2013 and 
continued to October 17, 2013, where evidence and testimony were entered into the 
record,  the Louisville Building Code Board of Appeals and City staff reviewed the 2012 
Editions of the International Building Code, International Residential Code, International 
Mechanical Code, International Fuel Gas Code, International Energy Conservation 
Code, International Fire Code, International Plumbing Code, Existing Building Code and 
the most recent State adopted Edition of the National Electrical Code and recommends 
adoption of the same to the City Council; and 
 
 WHEREAS, based on the findings in the Louisville Building Code Board of 
Appeals, Staff Report, the recommendation of City Staff, and the testimony of the 
witnesses and the documents made a part of the record of the public hearing, the 
Planning Commission finds that the proposed ordinance should be adopted in 
essentially the same form as accompanies this Resolution;  

 
NOW THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED BY THE BUILDING CODE BOARD OF 

APPEALS OF THE CITY OF LOUISVILLE, COLORADO: 
 
 The Building Code Board of Appeals hereby recommends adoption of the proposed 
ordinance, entitled “An Ordinance Amending Title 15 of the Louisville Municipal Code to 
Adopt by Reference The 2012 Edition of the International Building Code, The 2012 Edition 
of the International Residential Code, The 2012 Edition of the International Mechanical 
Code, The 2012 Edition of the International Fuel Gas Code, The 2012 Edition of the 
International Energy Conservation Code, The 2012 Edition of the International Fire Code, 
The 2012 International Plumbing Code, The 2012 Edition of the Existing Building Code 
and the Most Recent State Adopted Edition of the National Electrical Code; Enacting 
Certain Amendments to the Foregoing International Codes; Establishing Fees Under the 
International Building Code; Amending, Repealing and Reenacting Certain Sections of 
Title 15 of the Louisville Municipal Code in Connection with the Adoption of the Foregoing 
International Codes; and Establishing Penalties for Violations of Such Codes.” 
 



 

 
 3

 
PASSED AND ADOPTED this ____ day of _____________, 2013 
 

 
By: ______________________________ 

Peter Geise, Chair 
Building Code Board of Appeals 

 
Attest: _____________________________ 
 Ken Swanson, Secretary 

Building Code Board of Appeals 



 
 

Department of Planning and Building Safety          Building Safety Division 
 

749 Main Street   Louisville CO 80027   303.335.4584   www.louisvilleco.gov 

MEMORANDUM 
 
To:  Honorable Chair and Members of the Building Code Board of 

Appeals 
 
From:  Planning and Building Safety Division 
 
Subject:  Louisville Municipal Code – Contractor License 
 
Date:  September 19, 2013 
 
 
 

A draft ordinance for the Louisville Municipal Code Chapter 5.12 regarding 
the adoption of recommended changes to Contractor Licensing is attached for 
your review prior to the meeting.  
 
Staff is requesting your discussion and recommendation which includes a 
motion to approve a resolution of recommendation to be forwarded to City 
Council.  

 



 

 1

DRAFT 
ORDINANCE NO. ___ 

SERIES 2013 
 

AN ORDINANCE REPEALING AND REENACTING SPECIFIC SECTIONS WITHIN 
CHAPTER 5.12 OF THE LOUISVILLE MUNICIPAL CODE REGARDING 
CONTRACTORS LICENSES. 
 

WHEREAS, the City of Louisville is a Colorado home rule municipal corporation duly 
organized and existing under laws of the State of Colorado and the City Charter; and; 
 
 WHEREAS, the City of Louisville wishes to revise its contractor’s licensing 
provisions regarding type of licenses, testing requirements, license fee, proof of insurance 
and certified supervisor requirements for contractor licenses and to make other revisions to 
the contractor license requirements as provided herein; and 
 
 WHEREAS, the City has determined that it is in the best interest of the citizens of the 
City to amend the Louisville Municipal Code as set forth herein below. 
 
 WHEREAS, after a duly noticed public hearing held September 19, 2013, where 
evidence and testimony were entered into the record,  the Louisville Building Code Board of 
Appeals and City staff reviewed the Louisville Municipal Code Chapter 5.12 Contractors 
Licenses and recommends adoption of the same to the City Council; and 

 
WHEREAS, City Council has provided notice of a public hearing on said ordinance 

by publication as provided by law and held a public hearing as provided in said notice; 
 
 NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF 
LOUISVILLE, COLORADO: 
 
Section 1. Chapter 5.12 of the Louisville Municipal Code is hereby repealed and 
reenacted to read as follows: 

Chapter 5.12 CONTRACTOR'S LICENSES [1]  
Sec. 5.12.010. Licenses or registration required. 

Sec. 5.12.020. Application and fee. 

Sec. 5.12.030. Term and renewal. 

Sec. 5.12.040. Certificates. 

Sec. 5.12.050. Certified supervisors. 

Sec. 5.12.060. Certified supervisor required. 

Sec. 5.12.070. Classification of licenses and registration. 

Sec. 5.12.080. License and registration changes. 

Sec. 5.12.090. Responsibility for contracted work. 



 

 2

Sec. 5.12.100. Safety standards generally. 

Sec. 5.12.110. Permits issued only to licensed contractor. 

Sec. 5.12.120. Failure to obtain required permit or inspection. 

Sec. 5.12.130. Abandoning contract or departing from specifications prohibited. 

Sec. 5.12.140. Suspension and revocation. 

Sec. 5.12.150. Violation; penalty. 

 
 

Sec. 5.12.010. Licenses or registration required. 

A. Licenses shall be required for all types of work described in this chapter. The City requires all 
contractors involved in the construction, alteration, remodeling, repairing or equipping of buildings or 
other structures; or performing in the installation of underground utilities or construction of roads and 
streets in the City and on all City owned water, sewer and storm drainage facilities, to be licensed as a 
contractor. Homeowners residing on-site and doing work on their personal, private residence are not 
considered contractors and are not required to obtain a contractor license.  

B. Exceptions: 

Public utility companies will not be required to obtain licenses when engaged in the installation, operation, 
and maintenance of their equipment used for the production, generation, or distribution of the utility, 
product, or service through the facilities owned or operated by the utility company to the point of 
customer service.  

 (Ord. No. 1492-2006, § 1, 6-6-2006)  

Sec. 5.12.020. Application and fee. 

A. Every applicant for a license shall fill out a form provided by the city and shall pay the appropriate fee 
for each type of license at the time of issuance. Fees shall be established by the current adopted annual 
fee resolution for the City of Louisville, Colorado.   

 

B. The building official shall review applications and notify the applicant of the action taken on the license 
application. If the license is disapproved, the applicant may appeal to the board of appeals as set forth in 
Chapter 15.56 of this Code.  

C. The annual license fees to be paid for the licenses and registrations required by and enumerated in 
this chapter shall be as established by resolution of the city council.  

(Ord. No. 1492-2006, § 1, 6-6-2006; Ord. No. 1594-2011, § 10, 6-7-2011)  

D.The City does NOT require proof of insurance. By signing the contractor’s license the applicant is stating 
that they will maintain general liability insurance as well as the subcontractors they hire. 

Sec. 5.12.030. Term and renewal. 

Each license or registration shall be valid for one year from the date of issuance. All licenses are 
subject to annual renewal and may be renewed any time within one year of expiration. A new application form 
shall be filed and new fee paid upon annual renewal..  



 

 3

(Ord. No. 1492-2006, § 1, 6-6-2006)  

Sec. 5.12.040. Certificates. 

A. Definition. A certificate of qualification ("certificate") is authority to perform certain skills and is issued 
by the city upon receipt of the successful completion of an examination administered by the International 
Code Council covering the 2000 Edition or later codes. This certificate is not transferable.  

B. Temporary certificate. The building official may issue a temporary certificate when the applicant has 
previously exhibited his skills to the satisfaction of the city and the applicant's qualifications are 
acceptable. The building official shall determine the period of the validity of the temporary certificate.   

C. Examinations. All applicants for General A, B, and C license will be required to take and pass the 
International Code Council test covering the 2000 Edition or later codes.   

(Ord. No. 1492-2006, § 1, 6-6-2006)  

Sec. 5.12.050. Certified supervisors. 

A. Every supervisor required for a particular license in section 5.12.070 shall, upon demonstrating 
successful completion of an examination administered by the International Code Council covering the 
2000 Edition or later codes, be issued a supervisor certificate of qualification. The certificate holder shall 
be entitled to perform and supervise the work in the particular skill for which he is qualified and certified. 
This certificate is personal to that holder and shall not be construed to be a license.  

B. The certificate holder shall actively supervise the workmen of the licensee for whom he is employed in 
accordance with this chapter.  

(Ord. No. 1492-2006, § 1, 6-6-2006)  

Sec. 5.12.060. Certified supervisor required. 

A. Where required by section 5.12.070, each licensee shall have in his employ a supervisor who holds a 
supervisor certificate of qualification for that particular license.  

B. The license shall be valid only as long as the named supervisor remains in the employ of the licensee 
in an active, full-time capacity. "Active, full-time capacity" shall mean that the supervisor shall be available 
at the local office of the company, at home, or at the job site within a reasonable period of time.  

C. The supervisor shall take an active role in supervising and reviewing all work performed and materials 
used by the company in the process of construction. If the supervisor leaves the employ of the licensee, 
the licensee shall notify the city within three working days. Failure of the licensee to so notify the city shall 
be cause for suspension or revocation of the license. The licensee shall be required to obtain a certified 
supervisor within 30 working days after the date the supervisor leaves the employ of the licensee. If a 
supervisor is not obtained within the 30-working-day period, the license shall be deemed suspended until 
the supervisor is obtained and the city notified.  

D. If the licensee is an individual, the licensee also may qualify as the supervisor for that license, after 
any required examination. 

E. Electrical and Plumbing registration shall not require a certified supervisor. 

 (Ord. No. 1492-2006, § 1, 6-6-2006)  



 

 4

Sec. 5.12.070. Classification of licenses and registration. 

The City does NOT currently have reciprocating licensing agreements with other jurisdictions. The City 
will honor and does require test results from a national test (International Code Council 2000 or better) for 
General Building Contractor Class A, B, or C. 

TYPE CLASS FEE REQUIREMENTS ALLOWED TO PERFORM 

GA 
General Building 
Contractor 
CLASS “A” 

$150 
Provide passing test results 
of the ICC National Standard 
Building Contractor  “A” 

UNLIMITED Commercial building          

GB 
General Building 
Contractor 
CLASS “B” 

$100 
Provide passing test results 
of the ICC National Standard 
Building Contractor  “B” 

Unlimited Commercial and Residential 
building 

GC 
General Building 
Contractor 
CLASS “C” 

$75 
Provide passing test results 
of the ICC National Standard 
Building Contractor  “C” 

Residential building one and two family 
dwelling units, and  townhomes not more 
than three stories in height. 

D 
General Building 
Contractor  
CLASS “D” 

$75 No requirements 

All other contractors doing work including but 
not limited to; excavating, decks, pergolas, 
fences, roofing, windows, siding, concrete, 
masonry, elevators & signs 

P Plumbing 
Contractor $100 Provide copy of Masters, 

State & Driver’s License  
Unlimited Plumbing and Gas Piping 
Installation 

M Mechanical 
Contractor $100 Provide copy of Masters, 

State & Driver’s License  
Unlimited Mechanical installation including 
water heater replacement 

PM 
Plumbing & 
Mechanical 
Contractor 

$100 Provide copy of Masters, 
State & Driver’s License  

Unlimited Plumbing and Gas Piping 
installation & Mechanical installation. 

S Solar Contractor $75 

Must have licensed 
electrician with copy of 
masters, state and Driver’s 
License 

Solar installation and repair 

E Electrical 
Contractor 

NO 
FEE 

Provide copy of Masters, 
State & Driver’s License  Unlimited Electrical  

 

Sec. 5.12.080. License and registration changes. 

A. Change of name. The change of name by a licensee or registrant shall be reported to the city within 
15 days after making the change, on a form provided by the city.  

B. Change of address. A change of address of a licensee or registrant shall be reported to the city within 
15 days after making the change.  

C. New license or registration required. A new license or registration shall be obtained within 30 days 
after the creation of a new legal entity, even when one or more of the members, officers, or directors have 
a license or are registered.  

D. Dissolution. The dissolution of a corporation, partnership, or other legal entity that has been licensed 
or registered terminates the license or registration and no person may operate under that license or 
registration.  

(Ord. No. 1492-2006, § 1, 6-6-2006)  



 

 5

Sec. 5.12.090. Responsibility for contracted work. 

A contractor shall be responsible for all work included in his contract whether or not such work is done by 
him directly or by a subcontractor. A contractor shall be responsible for all funds or property received by him 
for prosecution, for completion of a specific contract, or for a specific purpose.  

(Ord. No. 1492-2006, § 1, 6-6-2006)  

Sec. 5.12.100. Safety standards generally. 

A. All state laws, provisions of this Code, or other city ordinances addressing measures for the safety of 
workers and the public shall be observed by contractors and registrants within the city, in addition to any 
requirements contained within this chapter.  

B. It shall be unlawful for a contractor to be careless or negligent in obtaining minimum safety measures, 
including appliances, apparatus, and equipment, to protect workmen and the public.  

(Ord. No. 1492-2006, § 1, 6-6-2006)  

Sec. 5.12.110. Permits issued only to licensed contractor. 

A. For any work requiring a licensed or registered contractor, permits under this chapter shall only be 
issued to the contractor or registrant or their authorized representative.  

B. It shall be unlawful for any person to fraudulently use a license or registration issued to a contractor of 
registrant under this chapter to obtain permits for another person.  

(Ord. No. 1492-2006, § 1, 6-6-2006)  

Sec. 5.12.120. Failure to obtain required permit or inspection. 

It shall be unlawful for a contractor to fail to obtain inspection services when required, or to fail to obtain a 
permit when it is required.  

(Ord. No. 1492-2006, § 1, 6-6-2006)  

Sec. 5.12.130. Abandoning contract or departing from specifications prohibited. 

It shall be unlawful for any contractor licensed or registered under this chapter to without good cause 
abandon any contract or undertaking, or to make material departure from the city-approved plans and 
specifications for any contract or undertaking.  

(Ord. No. 1492-2006, § 1, 6-6-2006)  

Sec. 5.12.140. Suspension and revocation. 

A. The building official may upon his own motion, and shall upon the verified complaint in writing of any 
person, require any person licensed or registered under this chapter to appear before the building code 
board of appeals for a hearing upon five days written notice, mailed to his last known address or served 
to him personally.  



 

 6

B. The building code board of appeals shall have the power to temporarily suspend or permanently 
revoke a license or registration if the holder thereof, after a hearing, is found guilty of or commits one or 
more acts prohibited in this chapter.  

(Ord. No. 1492-2006, § 1, 6-6-2006)  

Sec. 5.12.150. Violation; penalty. 

A. It shall be unlawful for any contractor licensed or registered under the provisions of this chapter to 
violate any provision of this chapter; or to refuse to obey any order issued, or neglect to pay any fee 
assessed, under authority of this chapter.  

B. It shall be unlawful for any person to erect, construct, enlarge, alter, repair, move, improve, convert, 
demolish, equip, use, occupy, or maintain any building or structure in the city, or to cause such work to be 
done, contrary to or in violation of any provision of this chapter.  

C. Any person violating any provisions of this chapter shall be deemed guilty of a violation of this chapter 
and shall be subject to the penalty provided in section 1.28.010 of this Code.  

D. The suspension or revocation of any license, permit, or privilege conferred by the city shall not be 
deemed a penalty for the purposes of this section.  

(Ord. No. 1492-2006, § 1, 6-6-2006)  

 
 

FOOTNOTE(S): 

 
--- (1) ---  

Editor's note— Ord. No. 1492-2006, § 1, adopted June 6, 2006, repealed the former Chapter 5.12, §§ 
5.12.010—5.12.350, and enacted a new Chapter 5.12 as set out herein. The former Chapter 5.12 
pertained to similar subject matter and derived from Code 1962, §§ 22A-1—22A-10, 22A-12—22A-31, 
22A-33—22A-35; Ord. No. 405-1973, § 1; Ord. No. 494-1976, §§ 1—3; Code 1977, §§ 5.12.010—
5.12.350; Ord. No. 514-1977, §§ 5, 12; Ord. No. 517-1977, §§ 4—6; Ord. No. 579-1978, § 11; Ord. No. 
580-1978, § 2; Ord. No. 603-1978, § 2; Ord. No. 718-1981, § 2; Ord. No. 807-1983, § 2; Ord. No. 1316-
1999, § 2, adopted Nov. 16, 1999; Ord. No. 1348-2000, § 3, adopted Nov. 21, 2000. (Back) 

Cross reference— Buildings and construction, tit. 15. (Back) 

 
 Section 2.   Severance Clause.  If any article, section, paragraph, sentence, clause or 
phrase of this Ordinance is held to be unconstitutional or invalid for any reason, such decision 
shall not affect the validity or constitutionality of the remaining portions of this Ordinance.  The 
City Council of Louisville, Colorado hereby declares that it would have passed this Ordinance 
and each part or parts thereof, irrespective of the fact that any one part or parts may be 
declared invalid or unconstitutional. 
 
 Section 3. Repeal.    All other ordinances, or parts of any ordinances or other 
Code provisions in conflict herewith are hereby repealed. The repeal established 
herein shall not be construed to revive any ordinance Code provision or part thereof that 
had been previously repealed by any ordinance which is repealed by this Ordinance. 

 Section 4. Effective Date.   This ordinance shall take effect on ________, 2013, 



 

 7

and shall apply to all new license applications and applications to renew existing licenses 
filed on or after _______, 2013.  
 
 INTRODUCED, READ, PASSED ON FIRST READING, AND ORDERED PUBLISHED 
this ______ day of ___________, 2013.  
 
 
  
       ______________________________ 
        Robert P. Muckle, Mayor 
ATTEST: 
 
 
______________________________ 
 Nancy Varra, City Clerk 
 
 
APPROVED AS TO FORM: 
 
 
 
______________________________ 
 Light, Kelly & Dawes, P.C. 
City Attorney 
 
 
  

PASSED AND ADOPTED ON SECOND AND FINAL READING, this ____ day of 
_________________, 2013. 
 
 
 
       ______________________________ 
        Robert P. Muckle, Mayor 
ATTEST: 
 
 
 
______________________________ 
  Nancy Varra, City Clerk 
 
 



 

 1

RESOLUTION NO. 2 
SERIES 2013 

 
A RESOLUTION RECOMMENDING APPROVAL OF AMENDMENTS TO CHAPTER 5.12 
OF THE LOUISVILLE MUNICIPAL CODE REGARDING CONTRACTORS LICENSES. 
 

WHEREAS, Chapter 5.12 of the Louisville Municipal Code establish regulations 
regarding contractor licenses within the City of Louisville; and 
 
 WHEREAS, the City of Louisville wishes to revise its contractor’s licensing 
provisions regarding type of licenses, testing requirements, license fee, proof of insurance 
and certified supervisor requirements for contractor licenses and to make other revisions to 
the contractor license requirements as provided herein; and 
 
 WHEREAS, the City has determined that it is in the best interest of the citizens of the 
City to amend the Louisville Municipal Code as set forth herein below. 
 
 WHEREAS, after a duly noticed public hearing held September 19, 2013, where 
evidence and testimony were entered into the record,  the Louisville Building Code Board of 
Appeals and City staff reviewed the Louisville Municipal Code Chapter 5.12 Contractors 
Licenses and recommends adoption of the same to the City Council; and 

 
WHEREAS, City Council has provided notice of a public hearing on said ordinance 

by publication as provided by law and held a public hearing as provided in said notice; 
 
 NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF 
LOUISVILLE, COLORADO: 
 
 The Building Code Board of Appeals hereby recommends adoption of the proposed 
ordinance, entitled “An Ordinance Repealing and Reenacting specific sections within Chapter 
5.12 of the Louisville Municipal Code regarding contractor’s licenses.” 
 

 PASSED AND ADOPTED this ____ day of _____________, 2013 
 

By: ______________________________ 
Peter Geise, Chair 
Building Code Board of Appeals 

 
Attest: _____________________________ 
 Ken Swanson, Secretary 

Building Code Board of Appeals 
 



 
 

Department of Planning and Building Safety          Building Safety Division 
 

749 Main Street   Louisville CO 80027   303.335.4584   www.louisvilleco.gov 

MEMORANDUM 
 
To:  Honorable Chair and Members of the Building Code Board of 

Appeals 
 
From:   Planning and Building Safety Division 
 
Subject:   BC BOA Vacancies/Term Endings 
 
Date:  September 19, 2013 
 
 
At the end of 2013, BC BOA will have one open vacancy, for an alternate 
position, and Bob Van Pelt’s term will be ending. 
 
Application information is available on the City’s website. 
http://louisvilleco.gov/GOVERNMENT/BoardsCommissions/HowtoApplytoaBoard
orCommission/tabid/554/Default.aspx  
 
The deadline for the application is November 14, 2013. 
 

http://louisvilleco.gov/GOVERNMENT/BoardsCommissions/HowtoApplytoaBoardorCommission/tabid/554/Default.aspx
http://louisvilleco.gov/GOVERNMENT/BoardsCommissions/HowtoApplytoaBoardorCommission/tabid/554/Default.aspx

	01.09.19.13 agenda
	02.07.18.13 minutes
	03.2012 Code Adoption Staff Report
	Date:  September 19, 2013

	04.2012 code adoption Ord (9-12-13)
	05.Res No 1 2012 Building Code
	 SERIES 2013

	06.Contractor License Memo
	Date:  September 19, 2013

	07.Contractor Licensing Ord
	Chapter 5.12 CONTRACTOR'S LICENSES [1] 

	08.Contractor Licensing Reso
	09.BC BOA VacanciesTerm Endings
	Date:  September 19, 2013


